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Abstract—The transfer of positions from administrative 

positions to functional ones is one of the implementations of the 

bureaucratic simplification policy to 2 levels in government 

agencies in Indonesia. The problem occurs because the transfer 

of positions was carried out in a short time without being 

preceded by an in-depth study. This condition has an impact on 

the decline in the performance of functional officials resulting 

from the transfer of positions which has an impact on the decline 

in organizational performance. This study aims to analyse the 

process of transferring administrative positions to functional 

positions in order to formulate input for improvements in policy 

implementation in the field. The research method uses a 

qualitative descriptive approach. Research informants are 

determined snowball with key persons of Government Officials 

and related functional officials. Data collection was carried out 

through observation, in-depth interviews, and literature study. 

Data analysis techniques with data reduction, presentation, and 

conclusion. The validity of the data using source and data 

triangulation techniques. Theory uses human resources 

management system theory. The results showed that the transfer 

of administrative positions to functional positions in government 

agencies needs to consider organizational, resource, development, 

reward management and employee relations factors. 

Recommendations in the form of policy suggestions to improve 

arrangements for transferring administrative positions to 

functional ones. 

Keywords—transfer of positions, administrative position, 

functional position, human resources management system 

I. INTRODUCTION 

Bureaucracy is a combination of structural and post-
structural approaches [1]. One of the obstacles in bureaucratic 
reform is its large structure [2]. Bureaucratic reform can be 
achieved through increasing technical efficiency in order to 
obtain more productive public services, especially when the 
need for fiscal is urgent so that it can reduce public spending 
and the overall tax burden [2-5].  

The policy of simplifying the bureaucracy in Indonesia is 
not a simple matter. Many regulations have to be changed and 
re-harmonized through deregulation and streamlining of the 
organizational structure which has led to a re-bureaucratization 
of organizational procedures [6]. Therefore, it is necessary to 
have proper documentation and auditing so that every step 
taken can identify the pattern in order to determine the 
procedures that need to be trimmed. Bureaucratic 
simplification experiences various obstacles, one of which is a 
bureaucratic disease called bureunomia by Warsito Utomo in 
Damanhuri and Jawandi [7]. This disease affects the degree of 
government policy level or when it is formulated compared to 
the technical operational implementation of government alone 
[8]. 

One clear example of bureaucratic simplification is 
institutional changes and bureaucratic work procedures caused 
by the use of information and communication technology (ICT) 
as a form of innovation and the consequences of the digital era 
in various parts of the world today [7,9-13]. Government 
organizations are constantly undergoing changes in the form of 
reorganization and restructuring, such as major mergers, to 
achieve public goals and to strengthen their position in the 
public decision-making process [14]. In the last few decades, 
we have seen a move of public restructuring from New Public 
Management (NPM), which has brought increased vertical and 
horizontal specialization, to post-NPM with a focus on vertical 
and horizontal integration [15]. 

The phenomenon of simplifying the bureaucracy has 
appeared in several countries. Singapore, for example, has 
started bureaucratic simplification since 1980 and has been 
named one of the best countries in terms of efficient 
bureaucracy and reliable quality of public services. South 
Korea laid the foundations for simplifying the bureaucracy 
through various laws and regulations, such as civil service 
ethics, social purification movements, civil service awareness 
reform, control of retired civil servants, and the recruitment of 
civil servants. Meanwhile, the simplification of the bureaucracy 
in China was carried out by reducing the number of 

Advances in Economics, Business and Management Research, volume 191

Proceedings of the 3rd Annual International Conference on Public and Business

Administration (AICoBPA 2020)

Copyright © 2021 The Authors. Published by Atlantis Press International B.V.
This is an open access article distributed under the CC BY-NC 4.0 license -http://creativecommons.org/licenses/by-nc/4.0/. 333



government ministries, departments, and agencies from 100 to 
61 institutions and 30,000 party cadres were granted early 
retirement. As a result, Deng created an efficient, clean, anti-
corruption, serving and lean bureaucracy that made China 
currently grow into a strong economy [16-19]. 

The policy of simplifying the bureaucracy in Indonesia to 
two levels is a follow-up to President Joko Widodo's 
inauguration speech in the 2019-2024 government period on 
October 20, 2019. This policy of bureaucratic simplification is 
intended to shift structural positions into functional ones. The 
basis for this policy making is based on the composition of the 
state civil apparatus in 2019 which includes 10.26% or 440,029 
people out of 4,286,918 people who are administrative 
officials. One form of implementation of this policy is the 
enactment of the Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic 
Reform Regulation number 28 of 2019 concerning 
Equalization of Administrative Positions into Functional 
Positions [20]. This ministerial regulation states that the 
equalization of administrative positions into functional 
positions, hereinafter referred to as transfer of positions, is the 
appointment of administrative officers to functional positions 
through adjustment/inpassing of equivalent functional 
positions. Implementation of this policy until June 2020, 
namely the transfer of administrator positions to intermediate 
expert functional positions totalling 2.93%, executive positions 
to functional positions of young experts 2.53% and executing 
positions to first expert positions 0.49%. In October 2019, the 
Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform was 
appointed as one of the agencies implementing the bureaucratic 
simplification policy in Indonesia. 

In transferring positions, it is necessary to consider the 
principle of the right man on the right place [21], namely: First, 
there is good job analysis that describes the scope and nature of 
the tasks being carried out in the organizational unit and the 
conditions that must be possessed by the official who will 
occupy the position; Second, there is a job implementation 
assessment of each employee who is well maintained and 
continuously. With this job appraisal, it can be seen about the 
characteristics, skills, discipline, and work performance of 
employees. Besides that, in transferring positions, one must 
pay attention to the application of a human resource 
management system based on the concepts of efficiency, 
effectiveness and economy [22]. The aspects that need to be 
considered include: 1) organization, 2) people resourcing, 3) 
learning and development, 4) reward management, and 5) 
employee relations [23-26]. 

This study aims to analyse the process of transferring 
administrative positions to functional positions based on a 
human resource management system which includes 
organizational aspects, people resourcing aspects, learning and 
development aspects, reward management aspects, and 
employee relations aspects. The results of this analysis are used 
to formulate input for improvement in the implementation of 
the policy of transferring administrator positions to functional 
positions in the Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic 
Reform that have been carried out so far. The questions that 

will be answered in this research are: 1) whether aspects of the 
human resource system affect the process of transferring 
administrative positions to functional positions in the Ministry 
of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform? 2) how is the 
effect of aspects of the human resource system on the process 
of transferring administrative positions to functional positions 
in the Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform? 

II. METHODS 

This research used a descriptive approach, and the study 
was conducted qualitatively [27]. Research aims to describe 
systematically the facts or characteristics of a particular field 
factually and accurately using the case study method [28]. This 
research focuses on the Ministry of Administrative and 
Bureaucratic Reform. The focus of the research is the five 
elements of the human resources management system 
associated with the transfer of administrative positions to 
functional positions, which include: organization, people 
resourcing, learning and development, reward management and 
employee relations, which are then made questions as the basis 
for interview guidelines, observation guidelines and guidelines. 
literature review. This research is applied with descriptive 
explanations. Data obtained from sources directly related to the 
research topic. The validity of the data was obtained by using 
the triangulation technique of sources and data. Research 
informants were selected based on the criteria of those who 
understand human resource management in functional 
positions both within the Ministry of Administrative and 
Bureaucratic Reform and related agencies including 
professional organizations and elected functional officials. The 
data in this study consisted of primary data obtained through 
in-depth interviews and observations and secondary data from 
literature materials related to the focus and locus of the study. 
Data processing and data analysis were carried out by data 
reduction, data presentation and drawing conclusions / 
conclusions [29,30]. 

III. RESULTS 

The policy for transferring positions can be traced to 
various laws and regulations, including Law Number 5 of 2014 
concerning State Civil Servants [31], Government Regulation 
Number 11 of 2017 concerning Management of Civil Servants 
[32] as amended by Government Regulation Number 17 of 
2020 [33], Presidential Regulation Number 47 of 2015 
concerning the Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic 
Reform [34], Presidential Decree Number 87 of 1999 
concerning Functional Groups [35], Regulation of the Minister 
of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform Number 13 of 
2019 concerning the Proposal, Determination and 
Development of Functional Positions [36]. The most logical 
reason for this policy is of course the desire to create a more 
dynamic and professional bureaucracy as an effort to increase 
the effectiveness and efficiency to support the performance of 
government services to the public. The Minister of 
Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform is of the view that the 
policy of transferring positions can be interpreted as equalizing 
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positions through the appointment of Administrator Officers 
down to functional positions through adjustment or inpassing 
into equal positions. The criteria used are: First, job duties and 
functions related to functional technical services; Second, the 
duties and functions of the position can be carried out by 
functional officers; and third, positions based on certain 
expertise/skills. 

However, the lower level administrators can still be 
maintained with the following criteria: First, Have duties and 
functions as Head of Work Units with authority and 
responsibility in the use of budget or users of goods / services; 
Second, Has duties and functions related to the authority / 
authority, legalization, ratification, document approval, or 
regional authority; and Third, criteria and other requirements of 
a special nature based on the recommendation of each Ministry 
/ Institution to the Minister of Administrative and Bureaucratic 
Reform as a material for consideration in determining the 
position required for a position as Administrative Officer. 

As a milestone in implementing the policy of transferring 
administrator positions to functional positions, the issuance of 
Minister of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform 
Regulation number 28 of 2019 concerning Equalization of 
Administrative Positions into Functional Positions on 
December 6, 2019 as a legal confirmation of the Circular of the 
Minister of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform Number 
384, 390 and 391 of 2020 concerning Strategic and Concrete 
Steps to Simplify the Bureaucracy addressed to the Ministers 
of the Advanced Indonesian Cabinet, Governors and Regents / 
Mayors throughout Indonesia which were issued on November 
13, 2019. The Circular of the Minister of Administrative and 
Bureaucratic Reform states that bureaucratic simplification 
This is intended to create a bureaucracy that is more dynamic, 
agile, and professional in an effort to increase the effectiveness 
and efficiency to support the performance of government 
services to the public. This was followed by efforts to improve 
the competence of State Civil Service Employees. This 
Circular Letter contains strategic and concrete steps that must 
be taken including identification, mapping, alignment of needs, 
socialization, carrying out the transformation process, and 
transferring administrative positions to functional positions. 

The Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform as 
the ministry that organizes government affairs in the field of 
the state apparatus is appointed as the agency that first applies 
the transfer of administrative positions to functional positions. 
Of the existing 141 administrative positions, 97.87% were 
transferred, consisting of 98.07% Ahli Madya and 77.43% Ahli 
Muda (table 1). 

TABLE I.  NUMBER OF ADMINISTRATIVE POSITIONS TRANSFERRED TO 

FUNCTIONAL POSITIONS AS OF JUNE 2020 AT THE MINISTRY OF 

ADMINISTRATIVE AND BUREAUCRATIC REFORM 

Administration Position Positions that change to 

Functional Positions 

 

Information  
Type Number Level Number % 

Administrator 52 Ahli 

Madya 

51 98,07 Left with 1 

administrator 

position and 2 Supervisory 89 Ahli 87 77,43 

Muda supervisory 

positions 

Total number 141 Total 

number 

138 97,87  

   Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform, 2020. 

 
Strategic Steps of Bureaucratic Simplification at the 

Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform: First, 
Identifying Echelon III and Echelon IV work units that can be 
simplified and shifted their structural positions according to the 
job map starting October 2019; Second, Mapping the positions 
and structural officers of Echelon III and Echelon IV in work 
units affected by the transition and at the same time identifying 
the equivalence of these positions with functional positions that 
will be occupied in October 2019; Third, Mapping functional 
positions that can and are needed to accommodate the 
transition of Echelon III and Echelon IV structural officials 
who were affected by cuts as a result of the bureaucratic 
simplification policy in October 2019; Fourth, Aligning budget 
requirements related to income in positions affected by the 
November 2020 bureaucratic simplification policy; Fifth, Carry 
out socialization and provide understanding to all employees 
regarding the policy of simplifying the bureaucracy, so that 
each employee can adjust to a dynamic, agile and professional 
organizational structure in order to improve organizational 
performance and public services in November 2019; Sixth, 
Submission of simplification activity proposals to the Minister 
of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform in the form of 
softcopy in December 2019; Seventh, Determination of the 
Organizational Structure and Work Procedure of the Minister 
of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform which is the result 
of simplifying the bureaucracy in December 2020; Eighth, The 
process of transforming Echelon III, and Echelon IV structural 
positions into functional positions is carried out based on the 
mapping results in January 2020; Ninth, Carry out a transfer of 
positions in a professional manner, free from corruption, and 
without conflicts of interest while still applying the principle of 
prudence, in line with good governance, and guided by the 
provisions of the legislation in February 2020; dan Tenth, 
Carry out follow-up of personnel administration documents in 
the transfer of structural positions Echelon III and Echelon IV 
to further functional positions in the Regulation of the Minister 
for Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform through the 
appointment of inpassing/adjustments to functional positions 
specifically in February 2020. 

IV. DISCUSSION 

The implementation of the transfer of administrative 
positions to functional positions in the Ministry of 
Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform, if it is linked to the 
concept of human resource management of state civil servants 
(ASN management), the following can be identified: First, 
there is a change in functional position with the promulgation 
of a Government Regulation Number 17 of 2020 concerning 
Amendments to Government Regulation Number 11 of 2017 
concerning Management of Civil Servants. This condition 
affects the preparation and determination of needs and their 
procurement; Second, ranks and positions for functional 
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positions have not yet been determined considering that the 
applicable rank provisions are still pending the stipulation of 
the Government Regulation on Salary and Allowances; Third, 
career patterns and career development for functional positions 
still require implementing regulations for the Ministry of 
Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform Regulations 
concerning functional positions, especially on placement 
policies, certification and competency tests at the time of 
transfer of positions; Fourth, promotions and transfers for 
functional positions still require clarity considering that 
functional positions are related to other functional professions 
that are in the same office and have a cross section of duties 
and functions; Fifth, the performance appraisal for functional 
positions still uses the employee performance target assessment 
(SKP) pattern with the old provisions based on Government 
Implementation Regulation Number 46 of 2011 concerning 
Civil Servant Performance Assessment; Sixth, the 
remuneration and allowances and awards received by 
functional positions are lower than the equivalent structural 
positions before the transfer of positions; and Seven, the 
provisions regarding discipline, dismissal, pension security and 
old age security as well as protection for functional positions 
are still the same as those prior to the implementation of the 
position transfer policy. 

The research was conducted by using qualitative methods 
and using primary data obtained through in-depth interviews. 
Limitations in this study include the subjectivity of the 
researcher. This research is highly dependent on the 
researcher's interpretation of the implied meaning of the 
interview so that the tendency to bias remains. To reduce bias, 
a triangulation process is carried out, namely triangulation of 
sources and methods. Source triangulation was done by cross 
checking the data with the facts from different informants and 
from other research results. While the method triangulation is 
done by using several methods in data collection, namely in-
depth interviews, and observation methods. 

V. CONCLUSION 

The results showed that aspects of the human resource 
system affected the process of transferring administrative 
positions to functional positions in the Ministry of 
Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform. The influence of 
aspects of the human resource system on the process of 
transferring an administrative position to a functional position 
in the Ministry of Administrative and Bureaucratic Reform 
includes clarity of position in the organization, availability of 
resources, competency development, management of reward 
management and clarity of relations between employees. 
Aspects of the human resource system affect the process of 
transferring positions both before, during and after the transfer 
of positions. Recommendations that can be given are that the 
transfer of administrative positions to functional ones needs to 
be carried out through in-depth studies, preparing preconditions 
for employees to prepare themselves, planning employee 
careers and preparing an equal compensation system and 

drafting a work relationship in accordance with organizational 
changes. 
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